No. A-12030/03/2017-CLS-11
Government of India
Ministry of Labour & Employment

ok ok kokok

Shram Shakti Bhawan, Rafi Marg,
New Delthi — 110001,

Dated 05.09.2017
To,

The Registrar General,
All High Courts.

Sub: Filling up the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial

Tribunal-cum-Labour Court/National Industrial Tribunal, Mumbai-I.

Sir,

I am directed to say that the post of Presiding Officer of Central Government Industrial
Tribunal-cum-Labour Court (CGIT-cum-LC)/National Industrial Tribunal (NIT) at Mumbai-I is to
be filled up shortly in accordance with the provisions contained in Sections 7 & 7B of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (relevant extract of the Act placed at Annexure-I). According to
these provisions, the post can be held by a judicial officer who is, or has been, a Judge of a
High Court. A serving Judge can be appointed on transfer on deputation basis for a fixed term.
A retired Judge can be appointed on re-employment basis. The terms and conditions of
appointment of a Judge to the post of Presiding Officer will be as per Annexure-II [The
Presiding Officers of the Labour Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribuna! (Salaries,
Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service) Rules, 2015].

2. The pay attached to the post of Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum-LC/NIT, Mumbai-I is
Rs.80,000/- (fixed) per month.

3. It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who are willing to be appointed
as Presiding Officer of CGIT-cum~-LC/NIT, Mumbai-I and who fulfill the eligibility conditions may
please be furnished so_as to reach this Ministry within a period of one month from the date of
issue of this letter i.e. by 04.10.2017 for selection of a suitable officer. The Bio-Data of each
officer may be furnished in the proforma placed at Annexure-IIX to be filled by the concerned
officer and o be attested by the concerned Registrar General,

4, It is requested that a panel of names of judicial officers who fulfill the requirements, as
mentioned above and are willing to take up the assignment on terms and conditions mentioned
in the enclosed rules (Annexure-II) may please be furnished to this Ministry along with
Annexure-III.

5. It is urged that filling of details of each of the officers in each of the proformas and the
last date of sending of applications may strictly be adhered to. It is informed that only the
nominations_ with _complete proformas (Annexure-III) received on/before
04.10.2017 will be considered by the Ministry. The matter may kindly be treated as
urgent.

Continued on Page 2



e e e

Sec. 7] The Indusirial Disputes Act, 1947 19

(2} A conciliation officer may be appointed for a specified area or for
specified industries in a specified area or for one or more specified industries and
either permanently or for a limited period.

5. Beards of Conciliation—(1) The appropriale Government may as
occasion arises by notification in the Official Gazette constitute a Board of
Cunciliation for promoling the setllement of an industrial dispute.

(2) A Board shall consist of a chairman and two or four OEC members, as
the appropriate Goverrunent thinks fil.

(3) The chairman shall be an independent person and the other members
shall be persons appoinled in equal numbers to represent the partics to the
dispuie amd any person appointed to represent a party shall be appointed on the
recommendation of that parly:

Provided Lhat, if any party fails to make a recommendation as aforesaid
within the prescribed time, the appropriate Covernment shall appoint such
persons as it thinks fit to represenl thatl partly.

(4) A Board, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithslanding the
absenve of the chairman or any of s members or any vacancy in its number:

Provided that if the appropriate Government netifies the Board that the
services of the chairman or of any other member have censed to be available, the
Board shall not act until a new chairman or member, as lhe case may be, has
been appoinled.

6. Courts of Inquiry.—(1} The appropriate Government may as occasion
arises by notiticalion in the Official Gazette constitile a Court of Inguiry for
inquiring into any maltter appearing to be connected with or relevant to an
industrial dispute. .

{2} A Court may consist of one independent person or of such number of
independen! persons as the appropriate Government may think fit and where a
Courl consists of lwo or more members, one of them shall be appointed as the
chairman.

(3) A Court, having the prescribed quorum, may act notwithstanding
the absence of the chairman or any of its members or any vacancy in its
number:

Provided that, if the appropriate Government notifics the Court that the
services of lhe chairman have ceased 1o be available, the Courl shall not act until
a new ehairman has been appoinled.

. Labour Courts.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification
inthe OEEE Gazette, constitute one or more Labour Courts for the adjudication
of -industrial disputes relating*to-any. matter, specified in the Second Schedule

7

and for performing-such other funclions as may be assigned to-therm-under this #

Act—

(2) A-Labour Court-shall- eonsist of one person only Lo be appoinled by the #

appropriale Government.

L Subs. by Aut 36 of 1955, sec. 4, far section 7 {w.e.f. 1-3-1857). Earlier seetion 7 was anuwnded
by Act 40 of 1951, see. 3 (w.el 26-6-1951),

e e v et o e e




20 The Indusiral Dispules Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

~{3) A perspn shall not be qualitied for appointment ¢ wm-gw:m.ﬁmammm officer »

&;EE S R L

Doul ]
{{a)_he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or»

or_an Addilional District Judge; or

Rty ok it o

(b} he has, for a pexiod of not less_than fhree years. been a District Judge .

umtz.: ,
[{d}] he has held any judicial office in India for not less than seven years;

of :
H(e}] he has been Lhe presiding officer of a Labour Court constituted,

“inidéf any Provincial Act or State*Act fornot less' than five years.]
() he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Comumissioner. (Central) or
Joint Conunissioner of lhe State Labour Department, having a
degree in-law.and. at least seven years’ experience in the labour
department incinding three yeags of experience as.Concilidiion

Officer: “~~ ™ ,
Provided thal no such Deputy Chief Labour Commissioner or
Joint- Labour Commissioner shall be appointed- unless-he resigris/
from-the-service-of the Central Goverriment or State Government, as
the case may be, before being appointed as lhe presiding officer; or]
i{) he is anofficer of indian Legal Service in Grade I with three years’

experience in lhe gradef” e b e

STATE AMENDMENTS
Andaman and MNicabar Islands.—In section 7, in sub-section (3), in clause (a) [now re-
tettered as clause {3)], for the words “seven years”, substitute the words “three years”.
[Vide Reguzlation 6 of 1964, sec, 2 (w.e.l. 29-4-1064).]
Goa—In seclion 7, in sub-section (3), alter clause {d), insert the following clouses,
namelyi—
d "{d1) he has practised as an advocale or atlerney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or in two or more such Courts in succession, or any Ceurt
suboedinale (hereto, or any [ndustrial Court or Tribunal or Labour Court
constituted under any law for the time being in force; or
(d2) he holds a dogree in law of a university established by faw in any part of India
or an equivalent degree and is holding or bas held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Registrar of any Industrail Court or Tribunal or Labour
Court constituled under any law for the thne belng in force for not less than five
¢ars; or
(d3} Nn holds a decree in law of o university established by law in any part of India
or an equivatent degree and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank
than that of Deputy Commissioner of Labour under a State Governvnent or a
Unjon lerritory administration for not lass than five years; or”.
[Vide Goa Act’S of 1987, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 21-10-1987).]
Gujarat—In section 7, in sub-section {3),—
ms in clause {b), after the words "Addilional District Judge”, insert lhe words “or a
Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge™; '
{i1) in clause Mn:. for the words “seven years” substitute the words “five years”;
(it} in clause (e}, for the words “five years” substitute the words “three years” and at
the end of the clause, insert the word "or”;
{iv) after clause (e), insert the following clause, namely:~—
“(f} he has practised as an advocale or atterney for not less than seven years in a
High Court or any Court subordinate thereto ur in any Industrial Court or
1y m:mﬁu_ Tribunal or Labour Court constituted under any law for the lime being
in force.”

ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sec, 3 {w.e f 15-12-1964d).
Clause () amitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 (w.e.f 21-8-1984).

. Clauses (a) and (b) relellered as dauses (d) and (e) zespectively by Act 36 of 1984, sec. 3 (w.c.f.
15121964}

4. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 4 {w.ef. 15-9:2014).

W

Sec. 7] ' The Induslrial Disputes Acl, 1947 21

{Vide Gujarat Act 28 of 1977, sec. 2]
Haryana.—In section 7, in sub-section (3),—

m..w\ for clause {b), substitute the following clause, namely:—

“(b) he is qualified for appointment as, is or has been, a [istrict Judge or an
Additional District Judge or; and”

(ii) after clause {c), inserl Lhe following clause, namelyi—

“{cc) he has been a Commissioner of a division or an Admninisirative Seeretary o
Government or an officer of the Labour Department not below the rank of a Joint
Labour Conunissioner for a period of not less than two years; or”.

[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1975, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976).1
Madhya annnwr.|5 section 7, after sub-section (1), insert the following sub-section,
nametys-—
Y “(1A) In addition lo the funclions specifiec in sub-section (1), the Labour Court shall
try offences punishable under this Act and the Acts specified in Part B of the
Second Schedule.”
fVide Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec. 3 (w.el 26-1-1982).]
I section 7, sub-section (14), as Inserted by Madhya Pradesh Act 43 of 1981, sec, 3 {quoted
above), has been omitted. )
[Vide Mudhya Pradesh Labour Laws (Amendment) and Miscellancous Provisions Act,
2003 (28 of 2003).]
Malharashira—In secion 7, in sub-section {3), afler clause (d), insert the following clauses,
namely-—— ' '
4 “(d1) he has praciised as an advocate or attorney for not less than seven years in the
High Cuurt, or any court subordinate thereto, or any Industrial Corrt or Tribunal
or Labour Court, conslitutéd under any law for the time being in force; or
{d2} he holds a degree in law of a uiversity eslablished by law in iny part of India
and is holding or Las held an affice not tower in rank than ol Deputy Registrar
of any such Industizal Court or Tribunai for not Jess than fiyg.years; or™.
IVide Maharashtra Acl 56 of 1974, sec. 2.}
After clause (d2), insert the following clause, nantely:— '

“(d3} he holds a degree in law of & university esteblished by law in any part uf India
and is holding or has held an office not lower than that of Assistant
Comumissioner of Labour under the State Coverrument for not Iess than five

ears; or’.
- |Vide Maharashtra Act 22 of 1976, sec. 2 (w.o.f, 27-5-1976).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh.—In sectien 7, in sub-section (3), afler clause (b), insert the
following clauses, namelyi—
?J he is or has been a District Judpe; or .

() he has beld the office of the Chairman or any olher member of the Labour Appellate
‘Fribunal constituted under the Industrial Disputes {Appellate Tribunal) Act, 1950,
or of any Tribunal for a period not less than two yenrs.”

[Vide Punjab Act B of 1957, sec, 2 {w.e.f. 3-6-1957); Punjab MQ. 31 of 1966 (w.e.f. 1-11-1966).}

Ed. The above said amendments were made priar to _.m:m amendmenls made by the Central
Agt 46 of 1982, suc. 3 {weef. 21-8-1984).

“_Er_n Pradesh—In section 7, after sub-seclion (3), insert the following sub-scction,
Tame u....lln

“{3A) In relation to industrial dispute other than that referred to in sub-clause (i} of
clause (o} of section 2 or in secdon 4 of the Industrial Disputes (Banking and
Insurance Companies) Act, 1949, the provisions of sub-section (3} shuil have
effocl as if— ’

(a) afer clause (c) the following new clanses (d) and (e} had been added:—
*(d) is or has buen a Magisirate of the first class for 2 period exceeding two
BELS;
{e) Ww a person possessing more than two years’ practieal expertence of
i adjudicaling or settling industrial disputes™; ’
(1) in the provisa afler the words “clause (1)” the words "ur clause (d) or clause
(e} had been added”. o :
{Vide Utlar Pradesh Act 25 of 1951, sec. 2 {w.r.e.lf 26-6-1951).]
Ed.—The above said amendments were made prior to the amendments made by Lhe
Central Act 36 of 1964, sec. 3 (w.ef 15-12-1964) and Act 46 of 1982, sec. 3 {w.e.f. 21-8-1984).
West Bengal—In section 7, in sub-section (3), for olause (b) substiule the following
clause, namely:— s ’ .
"{b} heis, ot has been, a District Judge or au Additional Districl Juclge; or”. -
[Vide West Bengal Act 35 of 1989, sec. 3 (w.c.f. 22-1-1949).] :




22 The Industial Dispules Act, 1947 [Sec. 7

COMMENTS

Right of Labour Court

‘The Labour Courl/Tribunal hag an inberent right in the interest of justice o seek
proper assistance and grant ‘leave’ 1o a party before it is 8%3%93& by a legal
practioner; T.X. Varghese v. Nichimen Corporation, (2002) 1V LL} (Supp) Bom 1018.

H7A.~Tribunals.—(1) The appropriate Government may, by notification in
the - OfficialGazette, constityte one or “more~Industrial-Tribunals -for - the
adjudication- of-industrial .disphies relating o any matter, whether specified in

i} peepret e beatnt S e iniallplrch o Mok

the B:cond Schedule_or. the Third Schedule *fand for _perlorming such other

~functions-as-may be- assigned-ta them under this Act]”

{2 A Tribunal-sHall- consist- of-one- person-only—to -be_appointed_by._the.

apprapriate Government.
{3 A person shall.not be qualified for 2 ppgintment as the presiding officer
of. a Tribunal unless—
(a}.-he is, or-has been,-a-fndge.of a-High Court; or™-
*l(aa) . hehas, for a period of not less than threg-years, been a District Judge
or.an Additional District-Judge; (1.
‘[{b)... he is or has been a Deputy Chief Labour Comunissioner (Central) or
: Joint Commissioner, of the State’ Labour_ Department, having.a
degree in law and at least seven years' mxﬁmimvn‘m in the labour
department.-inicluding ~three~years- of ~experience as-Conciliation
Officer:
Provided .that no. such, Deputy Chief Labour Comunissioner .or

Joint Labour Commissioner-shail-be appeinted_unless he resigns

from the service of the Central Government or State Government, as-

:.,mnum_u.Eﬁsﬁm\‘v,n.@hn._‘umrmw..wv.@mw:mammm:w,. presiding officer; or]

YH{c) he isan officer of Indian Legal Service in-Grade Ji-with three years’
experience in-the-grade’]’ - R :

(4 Theappropriate-Government.may, if it 5o thinks fit, appoint, fwo persons

as assessors. (o advise.the Tribunal in (he proceeding before jr.)

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assamu—In seetion ZA, in sub-seclion (3), after clause {a) insert the following clauge,
namely —
“{ax) he has worked as a Disérict Judpe ur as an Addilional District Tudge or as both for
a tota! pesiod of not bess than three years or is qualified for appeintment as a judge
of a High Court: :
Provided that the appoinhnent to a Tribunal of an person qualified under this
clause shall not be made without consultation with Pmm Assam Higly Court; or”.
[Vily Assam Act 8 of 1962, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 30-4-1962).] K [
Bibar—In section 7A, in sub-section (3). after clause {a) insest the following clause,
namely=— ' L
“(aa} he has worked as a District Judpe or as an Additional Distriet fudge or as both for
a total period of not less than three years:
Provided that he appointment to'a Tribunal of any person qualified under this
clause shall be made in consultaton with the High Court of the State in which the
Tribunal has or 15 intended to have, its usyal place of sitting; or”.
[Vide Bihar Act 20 of 1959, sec, 2 (w.ef. 7-7-1959).]

L Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, suc. 4 (w.c.f. 10-3-1957).

2. Irs. by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4{a) {w.e.f 21-8-1984),

3. Ins. by Act 36 of 1964, sce. 4 {w.e.f. 15-12-1964).

4. The word *or” omitted by Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

5. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 fw.e.f, 15-9-2010). Earlier clause (b) was emiitted by Act 46 of 1982,
see. 4 {(w.e.f. 21-8-1984).

6. Ins. by Act 24 of 2010, sec. 5 (w.ef. 15-9-2010),

Sac. 7A]

The industrial Disputes Act, 1947 23

Con——In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause {au), substilute the fellowing clauses,
namely:—
“(b} he is, or has been, a District tadge; or
{) he has, for a period of not less than three years, been an Additional District Tudge
; 0F an Assistant fudye; or
?: he is.qualified for appointment as a Judge of the High Court”.
[Vide Gon Act 5 of 1987, see 3 (w.el. 21-10-1987).1
n-.:.E.ﬁ..IF suction 74, in sub-section (3),—
{1} in clanse (aa), after the words *an Addilicnal District Judye”, insert the words “or
a Joint Judge or an Assistant Judge™;
{11} ir: clawse (b) [Ed. clause {b} has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 (w.e.l.
21-8-1984)], insert the word “or” at the end;
(i) afrer clause (b, insert the lollowing clause, namely:—
“(c) he has for not less than five years been the presiding officer of a Labour Court
constituted under any law {or the time being in force”.
[Vie Gujarat Act 28 of 1972, sec. 3]
n section 7A, in sub-scction (3), after clause (¢}, Inserl, the following clause, namely—
“(d) he holds a degree in law of a University established by law in any part of India and
is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of Agsistant
Cormmissioner of Labour under the State Government for not less than ten years”.
|Vale Gujarat Act 22 of 1981, sec. 5 (w.ek. 1-8-1981).
Ed. Phe above said amendments were made prior o the anwndients made by the Central
Act 46 of TOBZ, sec. 4 {w.e.f. 21-8-1084).
Haryana.—In section 74, in sub-section (3),—
(i} for clause {an), subshlute the following elause, namely:—
“(aa} he is qualified for appuinmment as, is or has been, a District Judge or an
Additional District Judge; or”; and
(i) afler'clause {aa), insert the following clause, namely:—
“(saa) he has bren a Commissioner of a division or an Administrative Secretary
Government or an officer of the Labour Bepartment not below the rank of a
Joint Labour Commissioner for a period of nat less than twe years; ur”
[Vide Haryana Act 39 of 1976, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 12-8-1976) )
Kerala—iu section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (a), substitute the following clause,
namely— ,
“{a} hu is, or has been, a judicial officer not below the rank of a District Judge, or is
qualifiedd for appointment as a Judge of a High Court; or”,
[Vide Kerala Act 28 of 1961, sec. 2 (we.f 27-7-1961).
Marthya Pradesh.—in section 74, for sub-section {3}, substtute the following sul-section,
namely;— . .
“{3) A person shall not be qualified for appointment as the Presiding Officer of a
Tribunal untess—
{a} he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Court; or
(b} he is eligible for being appointed o Judge of a Fligh Court; or
{c} he has worked as President of the Board of Revenue; or
(d) he has worked as a member of the Board of Reverwe for a periud of not less
than three years; or
he has worked as Commissioner of Labour for a penod of not less than three
YEaTs; Or

(e




24 The Industrial Disputes Act, 1847 [Sec. 7A

(€} be has worked as o member of the Industrial Court constituted under
section 9 of lhe Madhya Pradesh Industrial Relations Act, 1960 (27 of 1960),
for a period of not less than five years.

[Vide Madhya Pradesh Acl 1Y of 1988, sec, 3 (w.ef. 15-1-10989).)

Mahinrashira—In section 74, in sub-seetion (3), in clause (a), after the words “hudge of a
High Cowrl”, insert the words "or a Distiict Judge or a person qualified for appeintrmenl as o
Judye of a High Court”.

|Vide Mahnrashtra Act 2 of 1963, sec. 2 (w.e.f. 4-1-1963).]

In section 74, in sub-section (3), in clause {aa), for the words “an Additional District
Judge”, substinzte the words “an Additional District Judge ot an Assistant Judge or”.

Aller clause (b), {Ed. Clause (b) has been omitted by Central Act 46 of 1982, sec. 4 {(w.e.l.
21-B-1944)), insert Lhe following clause, namely:—

“(¢) he has for nat luss than five years been a presiding officer of a Labour Courl,

conslituled under any law [or the time being in force.
{Vide Maharashira Act 56 of 1974, sec. 3.}
Afler clause () nsert the following cause, namaly:—
“{c) he Lolds degree in law of a Cacm_.m_mw established by law in any part of India
and is holding or has held an office not lower in rank than that of
Assistant Commussioner of Labour under the Stale Government for not less than len
years,”
[Vide Maharashira Act 22 of 1976, sec. 3.}
Mysore {(Karnataka).—(1) In section 74, in sub-seclion (3), after cluase (a), insert the
following clause, narnely:—
“(aa) he is, or has been, a District Judge, or”.
[Wide Mysore Act 6 of 1963, sev. 2 {w.e.f. 31-1-1963} ]
(2} v clavse (22} as inserted Ly Mysare Act & of 1963, afler the words “Di
wwert the words “for a peried of not less tan three years.”
[Vide Mysore Act 25 of 1963, sec. 2 {w.ef 12-12-1963).]
Ed. The above said amendments were macle prior to the amendments made by Central Act
46 of 1982, sec. 4 {w.ef. 21-8-1984).
Orissa—In section 74, in sub-seclion (3), after elause (a), insert the following clause,
namuely—
“{na) he has been a member of the Orissa Superior fudicial Service for a period of 1w
tess Lhan seven years.”
[Viele Ouissa Act 6 of 1960, sec. 2 (w.ef. 17-3-1960).| .
Woest Bengab-—In seelion 7A, in sub-seclion {3), in clause (a), after Lhe words “High
Court”, insert the words “or a Distict Judge or an Additional District Judye”.
{Vade West Bengal Act 17 of 1958, sec. 3 {w.e.f. 22-9.1958).]
In section 7A, in sub-section (3), for clause (aa), substitued the following elause, namely: —
“(aa) he is, or has heen, & District Judge or an Additiana) District Judge; or”.
fVide West Bengal Act 35 of 1982, sec. 4.]

COMMEMNTS
Pawer to constilute Industrial Court/Tribunal

it Judge”,

Seclion 7A empuwers the appropriate Covernment lo constitule one or maore
Industrial Tribunals for adjudication of the disputes relating to any malier specified in the
Schedules. The Secend Schedule enumerates the malters which fall within the jurisdiction
of the Labour Court. The Third Schedule enumerates the matters which fall within the
Jurisdiction of the Industrial Tribunal; Jagdish Norain Skarma v, Rajasthan Patrika Luf, 1994
LLR 285 (Raj).

8ec. 7C} ) The Industrial Disputes Act, 1847 25

= N7B. National Tribunals.~~(1) The Cenlral Government may, by nolification
in the Official Gazelte, constitule one or more National Industrial Tribunals for
the adjudication of industrial disputes which, in the opinion of the Central
Governmenl, involve questions of national importance or are of such a nature
that industrial establishments situated in maore than one State are likely to be
interested in, or affected by, such disputes.

{2} A National Tribunal shali consist of one person only to be appointed
the Central Covernment. P Y ppoinisd by

\mwv A’ person shall not be qualified for appointment as the presiding officer

of a National Tribunal ?[unless he is, or has been, a Judge of a High Courl].
{4) The Certral Government may, if it so thinks fit, appoint lwo persens as
assessors (o advise the Nationat Tribunal in the proceeding before it.]

) 7C. Disqualifications for the presiding officers of Labour Courts,
.H.Ev.ﬁ:im and National Tribunals.—Np person shall be appointed 10, or
continue in, the office of ihe presiding officer of a Labour Court, Tribunal or
Nationa! Tribunal, if— : .,

(a) he is not an independent person; or
{(b) he has attained the age of sixty-five years.]

STATE AMENDMENTS
Assam.—In section 7C, in clayse {b), insert the following proviso, namely:—

“Provided thal where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Government attains the age of sixty-five years before the complelion of any
procecdings pending before him, the State Governunent may, if in the opinion of
such Government public interest so requires, order his conlinuance in office for g

: pened nut exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”
IVide Assam Act 3 of 1962, sec. 3 (w.ef. 30-4-1462).]
Punjab, Haryana, Chandigarh—In section 7C, for clause (b), substitute the followin
clause, namely:— ' ’ &
“{b) he has attained the age of sixty-seven years”,
[Vide Punjab Act'8 of 1957, sec. 3 (w.e.f. 3-6-1957); and the Central Act 31 of 19466.] -
West wc:muw.lb. section 7C, in clause (b), insert the foltowing proviso, name]y:—

“Provided that where such presiding officer of a Tribunal appointed by the State
Govermnent attains the age of sixty-five years before completion of any proceedings
pending before him, the Stale Government may, il in the opinion of such
Goverment public interest so requires, urder his continuance in office for a period
not exceeding six months for completion of the proceedings.”

[Vide West Bengal Act 11 of 1959, sec, 3 (w.e.f. 27-10-1954} |

. ’ : SECTION 7D
Gujarat-—Alter section 7C, insert the following section, namely:—

"ID. Cerlain Districs Judlges quadified for appointments on Tribunal comstituled
by State ncus.z“.z_.:h.l'ZoEEE...:&nm anything contained in sub-section (1} of
section 7A,— B

(1) The State Government may constitute an Indusirial Tribunal under that syb-
sechion for performing such other functons as may be assigned to it under this Act.
N ‘ﬂmv Where he State Covernment constitules a Tribunal under section 7A, the
Fribunal may consist of a person wha is, or has been, for a period of aot less than

L. Ins. by Act 36 of 1956, sec. 4 (w.e.L ;._.m..mmmd..
2. 'Subs. by Act.46 of 1982, sec. 5, for cortain words {w.ef 21-8-1984).

At e



TR o Elo Trio-33004/99 REGD. NO. D, L. -33004/99

The Gazette of Fudia

EXTRAORDINARY
uFEr [|—EUS 3 I-FUY (i)

PART II—Section 3 Sub-section (i}
TR | Wy
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 275 =% Faee®t, gueutaart, e 30, 2015/59M4 10, 1937
No. 275] NEW DELHI, THRUSDAY, APRIL 30, 2015/VAISAKHA 10, 1937

TR S TSI AT
ater=eT
7 f2eslT, 6 3rdeT, 2015

AT, 336(s0).—FET T, ey @ar sfafew, 1047 ) 4wy 38 i s (1) F
g () gIVT T TR 1 TA v g e R aemEn g, el —
1. dfer T AR A1) 3 Fra a6 S Are o e, s afiem A i sfeer
{éw,ﬂ%ﬁ?mﬁm%ﬁﬁa?maﬁwﬁ)ﬁwq,zmsél

(2) T T § IE THIGT F A & WA L9 |
2. gqftarsTe—(1) =7 Budi F or7 q B 719 § qewar a9ieT 7 —

() “sfrfres” & sheiifis fare aftfrm, 1947 (1947 7 14) s

(@) i afimny” & sdatas St a7, ST 7 AT O 79 & ey fraie atgweT & =y
 fRyger =afer afasa g
(2) I Rl ST GET &, 1 7w Brami ¥ v & aur ofvofie 7€ § oy afuatew § et g
7 T8 o § St I wfdfre & Fen aaw €
3wl e st £ Freriw afet & s F efafgiE £ 2o §, sffaghe £ saf
ATerToTaT i A i 2l s Farrgsr mradier €7 g F Fftn Gus o i sy 7 % Fo gni

1926 GI/2013 {h

g

4
Y
1
)
3
'

j



™2

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II-—SEC. 3(i}]

4, Faw—(1) T ey § TrEria AfeET w7 a7 80,000 w. (Fraa) wfdar it Fraw =7 & 2o
f o siavia Tamg Aradtet 6 g § gfafHgRe sor siv Tarfhes =t ) zom " Yo
dT &

{2) = =graTerg 3 R wfiew ¥ deri et o Faw e g —

(i) Fore wamarsfyer (wiefe w7) - 61,550-1230-58,930-1380-63,070 =.

(ify Frerr Frrervefier (= 9ofY) - 57,700-1230-58,930-1380-67,210 %,

(iii) Fer FaTIeTsr (sTfeETT &aw) - 70,290-1540-76,450 %.

ufer 77 ¥ Faw & Aaer Sow, Y90 aHGed 91 T Janag i & wras it g afr wrd

iy 7g & el aidFm F =9 5 TF =5fn 7 g #7 2om 7, St =S q97 9 39 9 99
AT (Fe2 1) AT ¥I50 BYET F 9 A+ v F FariRgy g $fv R Yom & A g G iy
¥ GRMAE F7 UTH FRAT AT WY WY 72T € A7 UTR F4 & (MU gE 2 AT g, e sfdedt ¥ g
s g & qwer YoM F avEy £ 76T 1 57 297 AT
5. HEATE WOl—Tgig AfdEwer 1 flenia sfdwm) fgars w59 5¢ ¥ 17 99 91 359 AT7A% F
v FATaEier 2T
(2) &Y SIS 7 S afierer F Ters afgwmial 1 97 a5qeq S2Te q97 TI5 w0 F
THASI 20T ST FeTd R & Wy AfEiray g ang-sua 97 svghoy S 9 tEr § S0
qafdTer €1 sy F 2w arefa suafat § ew ©ow ¥ w9 5 B s ¥ ad ¥ aewede
Eruill
6. AR wiRAqwH wET—{1) 7TE sftaver % fenf st € a5 a aftges w91 3 g 9 s
TYTEET & ~qTaTeliert #7 T ¢ |
(2 s =arETery o e stfgwen, § feefm afimhat § T afigws 99 5T TR ©
gy F aftEtat 21 aar A Fa F st iR g
7. TR Ramm —adg sftg & ferda sfimha § f F=0g gvae e gemr # gagr

S AT F R 9Y I TR AT gl Fesld e AT wHeE § AR, qw W Od Fey far
(PR wivsrat) Frerm, 1944 3 o 3wafla glteio &3 % forg geeare g1

(2) o\ =TT A st & ferEt afteial ¥ o, s gt s=09 qavwme
 HE F aTeEn a1 et AT WAt F w9 R gl
8. gil—rgm wfimer & (erefta afdmfat 5 o, get & 94fd awr 9 =) & w9
=TT T FAT IR B
(2) = =TT Ay el it ® ferde affaiva & fro, gt @ d6afile s =0
e o g atasriEt S 7 An) et ¥ qde Bt g
9. wa farr wu (1) T afimrn F ferlw ettt & g ferar s gafes amgi
at st R e e 7 A witer St 2w F v Rrerar s #r g8y By s )

(2) s =TT ST st gftmn F fe afiwriE § P g seew ¥ oagg w
FHATAT F B a9y seE w6 g @= 57wy G s




(9 11-T=YE 3(i)] UHA 1 ST STHIYIT 3

10, TrET WAl afterfrat €1 3795 [T £ g99 97 o6 &9 07 A99 gHIT F AT qTAT
ST 3 TFETE ZT |
11, gt ar Pearga—(1) Tty sl & Fawfta aftatal & o Sl avare % agay ol & Fro
T AT T S Fgra ¥ oy gl aray T gei
(2) = =raTery S sientfien sfirwr F Frewii sftmta F By gt ars faay derdia sty
Ft qrfaae ¥ e o7 e ¥ aven wwivarfe safe St gar sy Rt & g it 2o
12, aTgH wAT—{1) TENT e ¥ S sftrmiiat F R weha o g sy wey o e
£ 7% T w6y ¥ =9 § qTET w5 1 wa e Fhar s

(2) = =TATE AT ST sFee F e aiawia 71 a8 w72 B ar 3 ardg

FTAT % FAIS & 817 521 F1¢ 78 97 (77 J0e 1 T80 Thrag 9ew F0 T wagee Pray 92
TIT |

13. ETFTECT AT "l ~—(1) F5907 A0 F AvErT Fagt F g aqEy eeiae w6 e s
ST AT AH FTATAY FF FTGUL FIA F o0 [EANT H YA AF ST AHGEOA F HATA g G
AT ¥ T FT qF FT P G GH BT
(2) = FgrETEg qv e e F S afietat F R s g 9=
yAfATS 3 sve e R ¥ ard qaiiareig STn F N ST 5Y § aur vy RaEl &
AT, T !
14, sfterh wis-RY «fg—ferm gfEmtat #r aferd 9B =g 3 Rt ¥ g
g Ft w3 fe F 0T F T EF 2
15. svq FaT AL~—37 T o =rae Sn avr § 8 af¥ere suey T2 39w # wqege 4y a9
gt it Ay & eyt @ aat I g fiw gt w1 73T g F Sy F e g s, s
srferor o wrter erfReRver g REfe fom smiw, o = ave a7 99 a7 Bt aregesr g

16, TRrer s &t qRF — et o ST 29 e Rl aee A1 Bl At an wet T s A
Rrfirer 7 7 orfor 27T |

[#. 5=-25025/05/2013-F7#UH-2]

MINISTRY OF LABOUR AND EMPLOYMENT
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 6th April, 2015

G.S.R. 336(E)—In excercise of the powers conferred by clause (¢) of sub-section(l) of Section 38 of the
Industrial Disputes Act, 1947, the Central Government hereby makes the following rules, namely:—

1. Short title and commencemeni.—(1) These rules may be called the Presiding Officers of the Labour
Court, Industrial Tribunal and National Tribunal (Salaries, Allowances and other Terms and Conditions of Service}
Rules, 201 5.

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official Gazete.
2. Definitions.~—(1} In (hese rules, unless the conlext otherwise requires,-

(a) **Act’” means the Industrial Disputes Act, 1947 (14 of 1947},

B
&
b
%



4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART [[—S3EC. 3{i)]

{b) *Presiding Officer” means a person appointed as presiding officer under Sections 7, 7A or Section 7B
of the Act.

(Z) All other words and expressions used and not defined in these rules but defined in the Act shall have
meanings respeclively assigned to them in the Acl.

3. Duration—In case of appointment on depuiation of serving judges as presiding officer, the normal period
of appointment shall be for a period of three years and in case of retired judges, the appointment shall be till the age of
65 years.

4. Salary.—(1) The Pay of the Presiding Officer of National Tribunal shall be fixed @ Rs 84,000/ (fixed)
per month and this shall include the deputation allowance in case of serving judges and gross pension in case of retired
judges.

(2) The Salary of the Presiding Officer of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shail be-
(i} the Disirict Judge (Entry Level)  — Rs. 51,550-1230-38,930-1380-63,07C
(i) the District Judge (Selection Grade) — Rs, 57.700-1230-38,930-1380-67,210
{iii) the District Judge (Super time Scale) — Rs. 70,290-13540-76,450
per month inclusive of gross pension. pension equivalient or other retirement benefits. if any:

Provided that in the case of an appointment of a person as a presiding officer. who has renred from Judicial
Service or as Deputy Chicef Labour Commissioner (Central) or Joint Commissioner of the State Government and who
is in receipt of or has received or has become entitled to receive any retirement benefit by way of pension, the pay of
presiding officer shall be reduced by the gross amount of Pension from the Pay so fixed.

5. Dearness Allowance.—(1) The presiding officers ol National Tribunal shall receive the dearness allowance
at the rate as admissibie to the serving judges of the High Court.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal shall be entitied 1o dearness allowance as
applicable to Group- “A” Officers of the Central Government drawing an equivalent pay from time to time
subject to the condition that relief of pension is deducted from the emolument drawn during the period of
re-employment,

6 City Compensatory Allowance.—(1) For presiding ulTicers of Nativnal Tribunals, the city compensatory
allowance shall be as admissible to the serving judges of High Courls.

(2) For presiding officers of Labour Court or Indusirial Tribunal, the city compensatary allowance shall be
regulated under the rules as applicable to the Group =A™ Olficers of the Central Guvernmenl.

7. Medical Concession.—( 1) For presiding officers of the National Tribunal, the Central Government Health
Scheme facilities shall be available at the statior of posting and where the Central Government Health Scheme is not in
operalivn, they shall be entittled to the (zeililies as pruvided in the Central Services (Medical Allendance) Rules, 1944,

(2) For presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the medical facilitics shall be regulated
under the rules as applicable to the Group-"" A™ Officers of the Central Government,

8, Leave—(l) For presiding officers of the Mationa! Tribunal, the matters relating to leave shall be as
admissible to the serving judges of the High Courts.

(2)  For presiding officers of the Labour Courl or Industrial Tribunal, the matters refaiing 10 leave shail be
reculated under the rules as applicable te the Group- “A" Officers of the Central Government.

9 House Rent Allowance—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
rent free furmished accommodation or, as the case may be, the house reat allowance at the rate of thirty per cent of the
basic pay.

{2y For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal, there shall be proviced the House

Rent Allowance as admissible to the Group-~A" Officers of the Central Government.

10, Travelling Allowances.—The presiding officers shall be entitled the travelling allowance as per their
enfitfement on the rates at the time of their re-employment.

e

“

. AR

e
SR )

205



T TR

{9 11-@vs 3{i;] YR el IS 0 FEYURY 5

11. Leave Travel Concessivn~(1) For the presiding officers of the Nationzl Tribunal, the leave travel
concession for self and family shall be as admissible to the highest grade in the Central Government.

(2) For the presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunai, the Leave Travel Councession
shall be regulated under the rules as applicable to re-cmployed person in respect of Presiding Officers
appointed on re-employed basis.

12. Conveyance Allowance.—(1) For the presiding officers of the National Tribunal, there shall be provided
the canveyance allawance in the form of a fixed amount to be decided by the Central Government from lime to time.

(2) The presiding officers of the Labour Court or Industrial Tribunal may have an option either to have a
staff car for official purposes or use of own vehicle with a grant of seveaty five litres of petrol per
raonth.

13. Transfer Travelling Allowance—(1} The transfer travelling allowance shall be as admissible fo a
Government Servant of the highest grade from home town to headquarters for joining the National Industrial Tribunal cr
Labour Court and from headquarters to home town at the end of the assignmeni.

{2) For the presiding officers of the Lahour Court or Industrial Tribunal, the transfer travelling ollowance
shall be as per Central Governmeni rules as applicable to re-employed person in respect of presiding
officers appointed on re-cmployed basis.

14,  Contributory Provident Fund Scheme.—The presiding officers shall be entitled to join Contributory
Provident Fund Scheme as per rules during the period of re-employment.

R

15. Other Conditions of Service.—~Matters relating to the terms and conditions of service of the Chairperson
or other Members with respect to which no express provisions has been mude in these rules, shall be referred by the
Lahour Court. Industrial Tribunal or National Tribunal 1o the Central Government for its decision. and the decision of the
Central Governmert thereon shall be binding.

16. Power to relax.—The Central Government have power to refax the provision of any of these rules in
respect of any class or categories of persons.

[No. Z-25025/05/2013-CLS-1i]
DHEERA) KUMAR. Jt Secy.

Printec by the Manager. Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri. New Dethi- 110064
and Published by the Controlier of Publications. Delhi-1 10054,



Proforma for Bio-data

Annexure-III

(to be filled by the judicial officer concerned)

Name (in full}

Date of Birth

Educational Qualification

Particulars of Service in brief with dates of
each appointment held from the level of
High Court Judge

(In Chronological Order)

(Note: Experience with regard to Labour
matters may be specifically mentioned)

Details
in
respect
of last/
current
post
held

Name of the last/current post

Date of appointment to
last/current post

Date of retirement

Scale of pay

Last pay drawn

Address for communication

Phone no.

(Office)

(Residential)

(Mobile)

E-mail address

Date:

Place:

Signature:

Name:




